
From: Rachael Stevie (CD)
To: "Sam"; Val; rich.ozanich@charter.net
Cc: Jeremy Johnston
Subject: RE: BL-22-00003 Ozanich - Conditional Preliminary Approval
Date: Monday, March 14, 2022 12:27:00 PM
Attachments: image002.png

image004.png
image005.png

Hello,
 
The survey is good to be recorded!
 
Please send me a pdf copy once recorded and I can process final review.  It appears that taxes are
still due on both parcels, so please make sure those are paid because I cannot finalize the BLA until
they are paid in full.
 
Thank you!
 

  Planner I 
  Kittitas County 
  Community Development Services
  411 N. Ruby Street; Suite 2
  Ellensburg, WA 98926
  509-962-7637
  rachael.stevie.cd@co.kittitas.wa.us
 

From: Sam <samw@apssm.com> 
Sent: Monday, March 14, 2022 12:06 PM
To: Rachael Stevie (CD) <rachael.stevie.cd@co.kittitas.wa.us>; Val <valw@apssm.com>;
rich.ozanich@charter.net
Cc: Jeremy Johnston <jeremy.johnston@co.kittitas.wa.us>
Subject: RE: BL-22-00003 Ozanich - Conditional Preliminary Approval
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the Kittitas County network. Do not click links,
open attachments, fulfill requests, or follow guidance unless you recognize the sender and
have verified the content is safe.

 

Hi Rachael,
 
I hope you had a great weekend!
 
I typically do not email asking for updates on review but Mr. Ozanich is under a timeline and I was
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